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SOLUTIONS

Larinbean Data aystem

13 de agosto de 2010

Monica E. Hoyos Pacheco, Administradora Auxiliar

Area de Adquisiciones

Iris N. Quifiones Mejias, Especialista en Compras y Subastas
Programa de Compras, Servicios y Suministros

Ave. Barbosa

Esq. Quisqueya

San Juan, PR 00918
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Referencia: Modificacion de los Renglones - Contrato Nimero 07-7-75.

Estamos modificando los modelos para los siguientes renglones y partidas que seran
enmendados, segun se describe en los documentos adjuntos.

Renglén y Partida Modelos

Renglén 1, Partida 1 Optiplex 780 (Prevalece)
Renglén 1, Partida 3 Precision T3500 (Prevalece)
Renglén 2, Partida 1 Latitude E5410 (Modificado)
Renglén 2, Partida 3 Latitude E5510 (Modificado)
Renglon 2, Partida 5 Precision M4500 (Modificado)
Renglén 3, Partida 1 Lenovo X200T (Prevalece)

Cualquier duda o pregunta adicional, estamos a sus ordenes.
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, Nk
Gil V. Camareno Mendrell

Ejecutivo de Cuentas l)\)v/ ( ( (‘O
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Rehglon 1,Partida 1

Computadoras de Escritorio (Desktop)

Usuarios Regular - Procesador Intel

Caribbean Data System, inC
636 San Patricio Ave.
San Jjuan, PR. 00920
$.S. # 66-028-7124

Chasis MiniTower $675.00 2% Dell Optiplex 780 Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 afios
Procesador: Core 2 Duo E7500 / 2.93 GHz, 3M L2 cache, 1066 Mhz-FSB incluido
Chipset Intel® Q43 Express Chipset w/ICH10D incluido
Memoria: 2.0GB - 2 DIMM y tener 2 adic. (4 DIMM slot total) incluido
Disco Duro 160 GB 7200 RPM - SATA incluido
Video Card Integrated Video, Intel® GMA 4500 incluido
CD/DVD 16X DVD+/-RW SATA incluido
NIC Integrated 10/100/1,000 incluido
Mouse Optical Mouse - Scroll incluido
Keyboard: English incluido
USB Ports Cuatro (4) detras, Dos(2) al frente incluido
Floppy ninguno incluido
oS Windows 7, no media incluido
Garantia 3 afios on-site incluido
3.0 GB - MEMORY $100.00 Dell Parts
4.0 GB - MEMORY $160.00 Dell Parts
M
Semaria Tot 6.0 GB - MEMORY $250.00 __ |Dell Parts
8.0 GB - MEMORY $350.00 Dell Parts
250GB, 7200 RPM $38.00 Dell Parts
320GB, 7200 RPM $58.00 Dell Parts
500GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 16MB $98.00 Dell Parts
T8 7, 3.5" SATA, 3. (i i C 16MB
claceh;l 200 RPM S 3.0Gb/s Hard Drive with NCQ and 16 $106.00 o
Lmsco Duro 160GB SATA, 10,000 RPM $200.00 Dell Parts
160GB 2.5 SATA 3.0Gb/s and 16MB DataBurst Cache $38.00 Dell Parts
250GB 2.5, Full Disk Encryption SATA 3.0G/s, 8MB DataBurst Cache $198.00 Dell Parts
128GB 2.5, Solid State SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB DataBurst Cache $405.00 Dell Parts
160GB, 7200 RPM $89.00 Dell Parts
250GB, 7200 RPM $99.00 Dell Parts
320GB, 7200 RPM $114.00 Dell Parts
500GB SATA 3.0Gb/s and 16MB DataBurst Cache 5$140.00 Dell Parts
187 5" . 3. H ive wi
clacie,ZOB RPM 3.5" SATA, 3.0Gb/s Hard Drive with NCQ and 16MB $240.00 Dell Parts
s » M 3. H i
2do Disco Duro E:S;S: SATA, 10,000 RPM 3.0Gb/s Hard Drive with Data Burst $246.00 Dell Parts
160GB 2.5 SATA 3.0Gb/s and 16MB DataBurst Cache $102.00 Dell Parts
160GB 2.5, Full Disk Encryption SATA 3.0G/s, 8MB DataBurst Cache $246.00 Dell Parts
« 128GB 2.5, Solid State SATA 3.0Gb/s and 8MB DataBurst Cache $298.00 Dell Parts
CD-RW/DVD-ROM Combo 24X/24X/24X/8X Max incluido Dell Parts
CD/ovD
/ L DVD Rec 8x Max Dual Layer Roxio Creator™ CyberlinkPowerDVD $50.00 Dell Parts
DVI (Digital) Adapter Card, Full Height $35.00 Dell Parts
A 256MB ATI RADEON HD 3450 (2 VGA /1 TV-out), Full Height $120.00 Dell Parts
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Rernglm‘w 1,'Partida 1

Computadoras de Escritorio (Desktop)

Usuarios Regular - Procesador Intel

256MB NVIDIA GeForce 9300 (2 VGA /1 TV-out), Full Height $130.00 Deli Parts
Video Card (PCI Express) .
256MB ATI RADEON HD 3470 (2 DP or 1 DP / 1 DVI), Full Height $140.00 Dell Parts Caﬂbbean Data 'SY.Stem. Inc
512MB NVIDIA Quadro NVS 420 (4 DP), Full Height $625.00 Dell Part 636 San Patnc‘o Ave
uadro , Full Hei . ell Parts
512MB ATI Radeon HD 4550 (1 DP & 1 DVI), FuIIgHeight $195.00 Dell Parts S&n )Uan. PR 00920
1GB NVIDIA GeForce GT330 (1 DP & 1 DVI), Full Height $240.00 Dell Parts S.S. #66-028-7124
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $134.00 E170S
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $174.00 P170S
17 in, 1440 x900, contrast 600:1, Analog $127.00 E1709WFP
19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $155.00 E190S
19in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $205.00 P190S
19 in wide, 1440 x 900, contrast 500:1, Analog $160.00 1908w
19 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 800:1, Analog/Digital $180.00 P190S AlO
Monitor Externo 20 in, 1440 x 900, contrast 700:1, Analogs'/_E $202.00 __ |E2009W
22in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 700:1, Analog $200.00 P2211H
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 1000:1, Analog/DVI $349.00 P2210 AIO
23 in, 1920 x1080, contrast 1000:1, Analog/Digital $220.00 E2310H
24 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 1000:1, Analog/Digital/DP $488.00 U2410
27 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 3000:1, Analog/Digital/HDMl $712.00 U2711
30 in, 2560 x 1600, contrast 3000:1, DiEitaI/HDMI $1,494.00 3008WFP
Desktop No Extra Charge |[Dell
Chasis Small Factor No Extra Charge |Dell
Ultra Small Factor $45.00 Dell
Bocinas (2) $15.00 Dell Parts
Bocinas (2.1) con subwoofer $80.00 Dell Parts
Dell AX510 Sound Bar for all UltraSharp Flat Panel Displays (Black) $35.00 Dell Parts
Otras opciones
Dell AX510PA Sound Bar for all Entry Flat Panel Displays {Black) $35.00 Dell Parts
Floppy USB External $45.00 Parts
UPS with Automatic Voltage Regulation- SO0VA $130.00 BR90O
CFl (Customer Factory Install) $50.00 Dell Parts
E7600 with VT (3.06GHz, 3M, 1066MHz FSB) $75.00 Dell Parts
E8400 with VT (3.0GHz, 6M, 1333MHz FSB) $88.00 Dell Parts
) Q9400 with VT (2.66GHz, 6M, 1333MHz FSB) $125.00 Dell Parts
Q9550 with VT (2.83GHz, 12M, 1333MHz FSB) $245.00 Dell Parts
Q9650 with VT (3.0GHz, 12M, 1333MHz FSB) $325.00 Dell Parts
- Microsoft® Office Professional 2010, English $395.00 Dell Parts
Chassis intrusion switch option $5.00 Dell Parts
Otras opciones adicionales |intel® Core2 vPro Technology Enabled or Disabled $40.00 Dell Parts
Keep Your Hard Drive, 3 Years $45.00 Dell Parts
Dell 19 in 1 Media Card Reader $30.00 Dell Parts
- Dell V.92 PCi Data/Fax Controlierless Modem $48.00 Dell Parts
1394 FW Controller Card, FH $50.00 Dell Parts
Dual Drive Conf ig 16X DV, SATA and 16X DVD+/-RW $65.00 Dell Parts
GOLD Technical Support $99.00 Dell Parts
b Dell 1505 Wireless DCP Card Half Height,OptiPlex 780 $118.00 Dell Parts
Upgrade to any Chassis Optiplex 980 $245.00 Dell Parts
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Renglon 1. Partida 3

Computadora de Escritorio (Desktop

Jes

ision 3500

10 a 20 dias anos

Chasis MiniTower $1,132.00 2% Dell Prec
Procesador; Dual Core Intel® Xeon® W3503 2.40GHz, 4M L3, 4.8GT/s incluido
Chipset lintel® X58 chipset incluido
Memoria: 2.0GB - 2 DIMM y tener 2 adic. (4 DIMM siot total) incluido Car|bbean Data pystem, InC
Disco Duro 250GB SATA 3.0Gb/s with NCQ and 8MB DataBurst Cache incluido 36 San Pat cio Ave.
Video Card Intel® Integrated Graphics Media Accelerator 3000 incluido P 00920
CD/DVD DVD-ROM 8x Max incluido San Juan, F-p. 124
NIC integrated 10/100/1,000 incluido S.S. # 66-048-7
Mouse Optical Mouse - Scroll incluido
Keyboard: English incluido
USB Ports Cuatro (4) detras, Dos(2) al frente incluido
lFIoppy Internal USB Media card reader19:1, Dell Precision T3500 incluido
0s Windows 7, no media incluido
Garantia 3 afios on-site incluido
| Opciones Costo Adicional Modelo Nuevo Costo Nuevo Modelo
2.0 GB - 2 DIMM incluido Dell Parts
3.0 GB - 3 DIMM $135.00 Dell Parts
Memoria Total 4.0 GB - 2 DIMM $225.00 Dell Parts
4.0 GB - 4DIMM $250.00 Dell Parts
12.0 GB - 3 DIMM $1,500.00 Dell Parts
160GB SATA, 10K RPM Hard Drive with 16MB $230.00 Dell Parts
300GB SATA, 10K RPM Hard Drive with 16MB $395.00 Dell Parts
L 320GB SATA 3.0Gb/s with NCQ and 16MB DataBurst $68.00 Dell Parts
Disco Duro 500GB SATA 3.0Gb/s with NCQ and 16MB DataBurst $140.00 Dell Parts
750GB SATA 3Gb/s with NCQ and 16MB DataBurst $341.00 Dell Parts
1TB SATA 3.0Gb/s,7200 RPM Hard Drive with 16MB DataBurst $406.00 Dell Parts
160GB, 7200 RPM $147.00 Dell Parts
250GB, 7200 RPM $186.00 Dell Parts
2do Disco Duro 256GB Solid State Drive,2.5 $658.00 Dell Parts
500GB, 7200 RPM $270.00 Dell Parts
1TB, 7200 RPM $495.00 Dell Parts
CD-RW/DVD-ROM Combo 24X/24X/24X/8X Max $25.00 Dell Parts
jcp/pbvD DVD-ROM 8x Max incluido Dell Parts
DVD Recordable 8x Max Dual Layer $65.00 Dell Parts
ATI Fire GL V3600 256MB, Dual Monitor DVI Capable $50.00 Dell Parts
Video Card {PCl Dual 256MB PCle x16 nVidia Quadro FX570 $286.00 Dell Parts
Express) 512MB PCle x16 ATI Fire GL V7700 $730.00 Dell Parts
i N 1.5GB PCle x16 nVidia Quadro FX4800 $1,545.00 Dell Parts
- 17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $134.00 E1705
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Anaiog $174.00 P170S
< 17 in, 1440 x900, contrast 600:1, Analog $127.00 E1709WFP
19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $155.00 E190S
19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $205.00 P130S
19 in wide, 1440 x 900, contrast 500:1, Analog $160.00 1909w
PP 19 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 800:1, Analog/Digital $180.00 P130S AIO
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Usuario Avanzado (Power User) - Procesador Intel

Re'ng|dn 1, Partida 3 Computadora de Escritorio (Desktop)
e e 20 in, 1440 x 900, contrast 700:1, Analog $202.00 E2009W
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 700:1, Analog $200.00 P2211H
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 1000:1, Analog_/DVI $349.00 P2210 AIO
23 in, 1920 x1080, contrast 1000:1, Ana!oglgi_gital $220.00 E2310H
24 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 1000:1, Analog/Digital/DP $488.00 U2410
27 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 3000:1, Analoﬂgital/HDMl $712.00 U2711
30 in, 2560 x 1600, contrast 3000:1, DigitaI/H DMI $1,494.00 3008WFP
Chasis Desktop No Extra Charge  |Dell
Small Factor N/A
Bocinas {2) $15.00 Dell Parts
Bocinas (2.1) con subwoofer $80.00 Dell Parts
Data/Fax PCl Modem $45.00 Dell Parts
Otras opciones RAID Controller Cards $0.00 Dell Parts
Broadcom NetXtreme 10/100/1000 Gigabit Ethernet $65.00 Dell Parts
Microsoft® Office Professional 2010, English $395.00 Parts
Floppy USB External $75.00 Parts
UPS with Automatic Voltage ReEuIation— 900VA $130.00 BR900O
160GB, 7200 RPM $147.00 Dell Parts
250GB, 7200 RPM $196.00 Dell Parts
3er Disco Duro 500GB, 7200 RPM $270.00 Dell Parts
750GB, 7200 RPM $458.00 Dell Parts
1TB, 7200 RPM $505.00 Dell Parts
160GB, 7200 RPM $147.00 Dell Parts
250GB, 7200 RPM $196.00 Dell Parts
4to Disco Duro 500GB, 7200 RPM $270.00 Dell Parts
750GB, 7200 RPM $458.00 Dell Parts
178, 7200 RPM $505.00 Dell Parts
upg to Precision 3X00 Series $0.00 Dell Parts
lupg to Precision 5500 Series
Chassis Intrusion Switch $5.00 Dell Parts
Internal USB Media Card Reader $50.00 Dell Parts
Data/Fax PCI Modem $40.00 Dell Parts
SoundBlaster® X-Fl XtremeMusic™ w/Dolby® Digital 5.1 $150.00 Dell Parts
Broadcom NetXtreme 10/100/1000 Gigabit Ethernet $75.00 Dell Parts
Quad Core Intel® Xeon® £5507, 2.26GHz,4M L3, 4.8GT/s $200.00 Dell Parts
Quad Core Intel® Xeon® W3530 2.80GHz, 8M L3, 4.8GT/s $300.00 Dell Parts
Otras opcicnes Quad Core Intel® Xeon® E5630, 2.53GHz,12M L3, 5.86GT/s $612.00 Dell Parts
adicionales Six Core Intel® Xeon® X5650, 2.66GHz,12M L3, 6.4GT/s $1,700.00 Dell Parts
CFI {Customer Factory Install) $50.00 Dell Parts
Keep Your Hard Drive, 3 Years $45.00 Dell Parts
6X Blu-ray Read/ Write Drive $413.00 Dell Parts
* Dell AS501PA Sound Bar for all Entry Flat Panel Displays $50.00 Dell Parts
DisplayPort to VGA Adapter $42.00 Dell Parts
Dual Drive Conf ig 16X DV, SATA and 16X DVD+/-RW $95.00 Del} Parts
B GOLD Technical Support $175.00 Dell Parts
Dell 1505 Wireless DCP Card Half Height $118.00 Dell Parts
4.0GB DDR2 Non-ECC SDRAM, 800MHz, (4DIMM) $400.00 Dell Parts
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Renglon 2, Partida 1

Procesador:

Intel® Core™ i3-350M Dual Core 2.26GHz 3MB

$1,140.00

Latitude £5410

Usuario Regular - Pantalla de 14.1" con Procesador Intel

10 a 20 dias

Chipset: Mobile Intel® HMSS Express Chipset Incluido
Video Card Intel® Integrated Graphics Media Accelerator X3100 Incluido ~ A(
Memoria (*): 2.0GB, DDR2-800 2DIMM Incluido Caribbean[Patz >ystem, |
Disco Duro (*): 160GB, 5400 RPM (SATA) Incluido 636 Sar) Patricio Ave.
Display 14.1" - WXGA Incluido San Juhn, PR. 00920
CD/DVD 8x DVD +/- RW Incluido 3 028-71 24
Inic Integrated 10/100 Incluido S.5.#p6
Wireless Integrated 802.11 a/b/g Incluido
Modem Integrated 56 Kbps incluido
Keyboard: English Incluido
Ports 3 USB, PC Card (Type | y/o Type Il), Internal Speakers, Headphone/ ictiskdo
Speaker Out, Integrated Microphone
IFloppy ninguno Incluido
Bateria 6 cell Li-lon Battery Incluido
Peso menor 5.7 libras (con bateria) Incluido
0s Windows 7, no media Incluido
Garantia 3 afios on-site Incluido
| Opciones : Costo Adicional Modelo Nuevo Costo Nuevo Modelo
2.0GB-1DIMM $15.00 Dell Parts
|Memoria Total 3.0GB - 2 DIMM $85.00 Dell Parts
4.0GB - 2 DIMM $128.00 Dell Parts
160GB 7200rpm Hard Drive $30.00 Dell Parts
250GB 7200rpm Hard Drive $75.00 Dell Parts
320GB 7200rpm Hard Drive $115.00 Dell Parts
Disco Duro 500GB 7200rpm Hard Drive $258.00 Dell Parts
250GB 7200rpm FIPS Encrypted Hard Drive $175.00 Dell Parts
128GB Dell Mobility Solid State Drive $500.00 Dell Parts
128GB Encrypted Mobility Solid State Drive $570.00 Dell Parts
DVD-ROM 8x Max $0.00 Dell Parts
CD/DVD CD-RW/DVD-ROM Combo 24X/24X/24X/8X Max $0.00 Dell Parts
8X DVD+/-RW w/Roxio and Cyberlink PowerDVD $85.00 Dell Parts
|Display 14.1" WSXGA $0.00 Dell Parts
14.1" WSXGA+ $84.00 Dell Parts
14.1" WUXGA $0.00 Dell Parts
Video Card NVIDIA GeForce 9200M, w/256M $148.00 Dell Parts
Nvidia o ATl Radeon - 512MB (dedicated) $0.00 Dell Parts
g cell Li-lon Battery $45.00 Dell Parts
. Bateria Adicional 6 cell Li-lon $115.00 Dell Parts
Bateria / AC Bateria Adicional 9 cell Li-lon $240.00 Dell Parts
2 Years Extended Battery Service for Years 2 and 3 5108.00 Dell Parts
d AC Adapter - Adicional $45.00 Dell Parts
Adicional - Auto/Air/AC Adapter $125.00 Dell Parts
E-Port Plus, dock adds dual digital display and legacy port support $265.00 Deli Parts
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Renglon 2. Partida 1

E-Port, dock for charging, digital video, and USB / eSATA port

Computadora Portatil (Notebook)

$172.00 Dell Parts
support
' E-Legacy Extender, snaps onto laptop for serial, parallel and PS/2 $78.00 Dell Parts
Port Replicator support
E-View Laptop Stand, adjustable height for single or dual dispiay use $105.00 Dell Parts
E-Monitor Stand, for CRT or large flat panel monitor $105.00 Dell Parts
E-F|?t Panel Stand, sleek stand for flat panel monitor and port $132.00 Dell Parts
replicator
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $134.00 E170S
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $174.00 P170S
17 in, 1440 x800, contrast 600:1, Analog $127.00 E170SWFP
19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $155.00 E1590S
19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $205.00 P190S
19 in wide, 1440 x 900, contrast 500:1, Analog $160.00 1909W
Monitor Externo 19 !n, 1280 x1024, contrast 800:1, Analoﬂgltal $180.00 P190S AlIO
20 in, 1440 x 800, contrast 700:1, Analog $202.00 E2009W
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 700:1, Analog $200.00 P2211H
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 1000:1, Analog/DVI $349.00 P2210 AIO
23 in, 1920 x1080, contrast 1000:1, Analog/Digital $220.00 E2310H
24 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 1000:1, Analog/Digital/DP $488.00 U2410
27 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 3000:1, Analog/Digital/HDMl $712.00 U2711
30 in, 2560 x 1600, contrast 3000:1, DiEitaI/H DMI $1,494.00 3008WFP
Teclado y Mouse English - USB $40.00 Dell Parts
Externos Optical Mouse - Scroll $30.00 Dell Parts
Maletin en Nylon $65.00 Parts
Maletines Classic Leather Carrying Case $85.00 Parts
Mochila (Backpack) $95.00 Parts
Malentin con ruedas $125.00 Parts
|FingerPrint Reader $35.00 Dell Parts
CFI (Customer Factory Install) $50.00 Dell Parts
Intel® Core™ i5-520M (2.4GHz, 3M cache) with Turbo Boost $89.00 Dell Parts
Technology
Intel® Core™ i5-540M (2.53GHz, 3M cache) with Turbo Boost $157.00 Dell Parts
Technology
Intel® Core™ i7-620M (2.66GHz, 4M cache) with Turbo Boost $250.00 Dell Parts
Technology
Floppy USB External $75.00 Parts
. WebCam Quickcam PRO $108.00 Parts
Otras opciones -
AX210 Two Piece Stereg System $31.00 Parts
AX510 Sound Bar for all UltraSharp Flat Panel Displays $48.00 Parts
~ Stereo Earbud $16.00 Parts
Wireless® 370 Bluetooth Module $33.00 Dell Parts
Internal 56K Modem $48.00 Dell Parts
B UPS with Automatic Voltage Regulation- S00VA $130.00 BRI0O
Microsoft® Office Professional 2010, English $395.00 Parts
Intel vPro™ Technology’s advanced $39.00 Dell Parts
Resolution: 800 x 600 {native) / 1600 x 1200 {resized) $715.00 IN2102

Usuario Regular - Pantalla de 14.1" con Procesador Intel
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Réngldn 2, Partida 1 Computadora Portatil (Notebook) Usuario Regular - Pantalla de 14.1" con Procesador intel

Resolution: 1024 x 768 {native} / 1600 x 1200 (resized) $1,195.00 IN1100
incluye Accidente y Pantalla $155.00 Dell Parts
Garantia Adic. Dell Laptop Tracking/Recovery 3Yr $90.00 Dell Parts . S ata S!lﬂﬁml NG
Dell Laptop Tracking/Recovery & Data Delete 3Yr $130.00 Dell Parts C_aﬂbbea“ “ L
Keep Your Hard Drive, 3 Years $45.00 Dell Parts &36 Sa
upg to Latitude E5420 $0.00 Dell Parts
upg to Latitude £6410 Dual Core $95.00 Dell Parts
upg to Latitude E6420 Dual Core $95.00 Dell Parts ’ <
upg to Latitude XT 12.1 display $1,553.00 Dell Parts
upg to Latitude E6400 XFR $2,495.00 Dell Parts
change color case to Reggata Biue or Regal Red $20.00 Dell Parts
8.0 GB - 2 DIMM for Latitude E6400 $558.00 Dell Parts
8.0GB, DDR2-800 SDRAM, 2 DIMMS for Latitude XFR $498.00 Dell Parts
Dedicated SiRFstarlll GPS $598.00 Dell Parts
Otras opciones Rugged 12-Cell High Capacity Battery Slice $560.00 Dell Parts
adicionales E6400 XFR Shoulder Strap $45.00 Dell Parts
|Integrated Webcam with digital microphone $50.00 Dell Parts
internal English Backlit Keyboard $40.00 Dell Parts
Blu-ray Disc™ w Roxio and Cyberlink PDVD $588.00 Parts
Dell Bluetooth Keyboard/Mouse bundle $120.00 Dell Parts
GOLD Technical Support $115.00 Dell Parts
USB Flash Drive $40.00 Dell Parts
Internal Swipe Fingerprint Reader $39.00 Dell Parts
FIPS Compliant Fingerprint Reader $132.00 Dell Parts
Replacement Lamp for Dell IN2102 Projector $185.00 Dell Parts
Replacement Lamp for Dell IN1100 Projector $379.00 Dell Parts




lon 2, Partuda 3 Com utadora Portatil Notebook
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Procesador: 51,130.00 2%
Chipset Mobile Intel® HMS5 Express Chlpset Incluido
Video Card Intel® Integrated Graphics Media Accelerator X3100 Incluido
{Memoria: 2.0GB, DDR2-800 2DIMM Incluido
Disco Duro: (*) 160GB, 5400 RPM (SATA) Incluido
Display 15.6" - WXGA Incluido
CD/DVD 8x DVD +/- RW Incluido
NIC Integrated 10/100 Incluido
Wireless Integrated 802.11 a/b/g Incluido
Modem Integrated 56 Kbps Incluido
Keyboard: English Incluido
DAt 3 USB, PC Card (Type | y/o Type II), Internal Speakers, Headphone/ incluldo
Speaker Out, Integrated Microphone
Floppy ninguno Incluido
Bateria 6 cell Li-lon Battery Incluido
Peso menor 6.5 libras (con bateria) Incluido
0Ss Windows 7, no media Incluido
Garantia 3 afios on-site Incluido
Opciones Costo Adicional Modelo
2.0 GB -2 DIMM Incluido Dell Parts
’ 2.0GB-1DIMM $15.00 Dell Parts
[Memons Towl 3.0 GB - 2 DIMM $85.00 Dell Parts
4.0 GB - 2 DIMM $128.00 Dell Parts
160GB 7200rpm Hard Drive $30.00 Dell Parts
250GB 7200rpm Hard Drive $75.00 Dell Parts
320GB 7200rpm Hard Drive $115.00 Dell Parts
Disco Duro 500GB 7200rpm Hard Drive $258.00 Dell Parts
250GB 7200rpm FIPS Encrypted Hard Drive $175.00 Dell Parts
128GB Dell Mobility Solid State Drive $500.00 Dell Parts
128GB Encrypted Mobility Solid State Drive $570.00 Dell Parts
DVD-ROM 8x Max 50.00 Dell Parts
CD/DVD CD-RW/DVD-ROM Combo 24X/24X/24X/8X Max 50.00 Dell Parts
8X DVD+/-RW w/Roxio and Cyberlink PowerDVD $85.00 Dell Parts
Display 15.6" HD(1366x768) Anti-Glare LED Incluido Dell Parts
15.6" HD+(1600x900) Wide View Anti-Glare LED $95.00 Dell Parts
; 512MB NVIDIA® NVS 3100M $109.00 Dell Parts
Video Card
512MB NVIDIA®™ NVS 3100M for Quad Core $109.00 Dell Parts
9 cell Li-lon Battery $45.00 Dell Parts
Bateria Adicional 6 cell Li-lon $115.00 Dell Parts
o Bateria Adicional 9 cell Li-lon $240.00 Dell Parts
Bateria / AC -
2 Years Extended Battery Service for Years 2 and 3 $108.00 Dell Parts
- AC Adapter - Adicional $45.00 Dell Parts
Adicional - Auto/Air/AC Adapter $125.00 Dell Parts
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Renglon 2, Partida 3

Computadora Portatil (Notebook)

E-Port Plus, dock adds dual digital display and legacy port support $265.00 Dell Parts
E-Port, dock for charging, digital video, and USB / eSATA port $172.00 Dell Parts o -
support 6 '
E-Legacy Extender, snaps onto laptop for serial, parallel and PS/2 WPL
Port Replicator support 378.00 Dell Parts San Juan, R
E-View Laptop Stand, adjustable height for single or dual display use $105.00 Dell Parts
E-Monitor Stand, for CRT or large flat panel monitor $105.00 Dell Parts
E-Fl:tzt Panel Stand, sleek stand for flat panel monitor and port $132.00 Dell Parts
replicator
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $134.00 E170S
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $174.00 P170S
17 in, 1440 x900, contrast 600:1, Analog $127.00 E1709WFP
19in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $155.00 E190S
19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $205.00 P1380S
19 in wide, 1440 x 900, contrast 500:1, Analog $160.00 1909W
Monitor Externo 19 .in, 1280 x1024, contrast 800:1, Analog/Digital $180.00 P190S AIO
20 in, 1440 x 900, contrast 700:1, Analog $202.00 E2009W
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 700:1, Analog $200.00 P2211H
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 1000:1, AnanE/DVI $349.00 P2210 AIO
23in, 1920 x1080, contrast 1000:1, Analog[_D_igital $220.00 E2310H
24 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 1000:1, Analog_/Digital/DP $488.00 U2410
27 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 3000:1, Analog/Digital/HDM! $712.00 U2711
30in, 2560 x 1600, contrast 3000:1, DiEItaI/HDMI $1,494.00 3008WFP
Teclado y Mouse |English - USB $40.00 Dell Parts
Externos Optical Mouse - Scroll $30.00 Dell Parts
Maletines Maletin en Nylon $65.00 Parts
Classic Leather Carrying Case $85.00 Parts
Mochila (Backpack) $95.00 Parts
Malentin con ruedas $125.00 Parts
|FingerPrint Reader $35.00 Dell Parts
CF! (Customer Factory Install) $50.00 Dell Parts
Intel® Core™ i5-450M (2.40Hz, 3M cache) with TBT $52.00 Dell Parts
Intel® Core™ i5-520M (2.4GHz, 3M cache) with TBT $95.00 Dell Parts
Inte!® Core™ i5-540M (2.53GHz, 3M cache) with TBT $169.00 Dell Parts
Intel® Core™ i7-620M (2.66GHz, 4M cache) with TBT $276.00 Dell Parts
Floppy USB External $75.00 Parts
WebCam Quickcam PRO $108.00 Parts
) AX210 Two Piece Stereo System $31.00 Parts
Otras opciones -
: AX510 Sound Bar for all UltraSharp Flat Panel Displays $48.00 Parts
A Stereo Earbud $16.00 Parts
Wireless® 370 Bluetooth Module $33.00 Dell Parts
Internal 56K Modem $48.00 Dell Parts
B UPS with Automatic Voltage Regulation- 900VA $130.00 BR300
Microsoft® Office Professional 2010, English $395.00 Parts

Usuario Regular - Pantalla 15.4"con procesador Intel

sstem Ing

§1CH0 AVE,
. 00920
SS.#66028-7124
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Renglon 2, Partida 3

Computadora Portatil (Notebook)

Usuario Regular - Pantalla 15.4"con procesador Intel

WB$3 System, inC
636 San PRtricio Ave.

PR. 00920
28-7124

intel vPro™ Technology’s advanced $39.00 Dell Parts
Resolution: 800 x 600 (native) / 1600 x 1200 (resized) $715.00 IN2102
Resolution: 1024 x 768 (native) / 1600 x 1200 {resized) $1,195.00 IN1100
Incluye Accidente y Pantalla $155.00 Dell Parts
Garantia Adic. Dell Laptop Track?ng/Recovery 3Yr $90.00 Dell Parts
Dell Laptop Tracking/Recovery & Data Delete 3Yr $130.00 Dell Parts
Keep Your Hard Drive, 3 Years $45.00 Delil Parts
upg to Latitude E5520 $0.00 Dell Parts
upg to Latitude E6510 Dual Core $95.00 Dell Parts
upg to Latitude E6520 Dual Core $95.00 Dell Parts
change color case to Reggata Blue or Regal Red $20.00 Dell Parts
8.0 GB - 2 DIMM for Latitude E6510 or E6520 $558.00 Dell Parts
Dedicated SiRFstarlil GPS $598.00 Dell Parts
[Rugged 12-Cell High Capacity Battery Slice $560.00 Dell Parts
E6400 XFR Shoulder Strap $45.00 Dell Parts
Otras opciones Integrated Webcam with digital microphone $50.00 Dell Parts
adicionales Internal English Backlit Keyboard $40.00 Dell Parts
Blu-ray Disc™ w Roxio and Cyberlink PDVD $588.00 Parts
Dell Bluetooth Keyboard/Mouse bundle $120.00 Dell Parts
GOLD Technical Support $115.00 Dell Parts
USB Flash Drive $40.00 Dell Parts
Internal Swipe Fingerprint Reader $39.00 Dell Parts
FIPS Compliant Fingerprint Reader $132.00 Dell Parts
Replacement Lamp for Dell IN2102 Projector $185.00 Dell Parts
Replacement Lamp for Dell IN1100 Projector $379.00 Dell Parts
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Intel® Core™ i5-520M Dual Core 2.40GHz 3MB
Mobile Intel® HMSS5 Express Chipset

$1,550.00
incluido

10 a 20 dias

NVIDIA Quadro FX 770M Precision incluido
Memoria: 2.0GB, DDR2-800Mhz 2DIMM incluido
Disco Duro 250GB Hard Drive, 7200 RPM (SATA) incluido
Display 15.6" HD (1366 x 768) incluido
CD/DVD DVD Recordable 8X DVD+/-RW incluido
NIC Integrated 10/100/1,000 incluido
Wireless Integrated 802.11 a/b/g incluido
Modem Optional incluido
Keyboard: English incluido
3 USB, PC Card (Type | y/o Type Il), Internal Speakers, Headphone/ S
Rorts Speaker Out, Integrated Microphone ighudo
Floppy ninguno incluido
Bateria 6 cell Li-lon Battery incluido
Peso menor 6.5 libras (con bateria) incluido
0s Windows 7, no media incluido
Garantia 3 aflos on-site incluido
Opciones Costo Adicional Modelo
2.0 GB -2 DIMM incluido Dell Parts
2.0GB- 1 DIMM $0.00 Dell Parts
hMematia Total 3.0GB - 2 DIMM $0.00 Dell Parts
4.0GB - 2 DIMM $150.00 Dell Parts
SD0GB Hard Drive, 5400 RPM $186.00 Dell Parts
250GB Hard Drive, 7200RPM with Free Fall Sensor incluido Dell Parts
128GB Encrypted Mobility Solid State Drive $329.00 Dell Parts
|Disco Duro 256GB Encrypted Mobility Solid State Drive $682.00 Dell Parts
320GB Hard Drive, 7200RPM with Free Fall Sensor $106.00 Dell Parts
500GB Hard Drive, 7200 RPM $388.00 Dell Parts
64GB Dell Mobility Solid State Drive $98.00 Dell Parts _
250GB 7200rpm Hard Drive 5288.00 Dell Parts
2do Disco Duro 320GB 7200rpm Hard Drive $412.00 Dell Parts
500GB 7200rpm Hard Drive 5430.00 Dell Parts
CD/DVD 8X DVD+/-RW w/Roxio and Cyberlink Power DVD $68.00 Dell Parts
Blu-ray Disc™ w Roxio and Cyberlink PDVD™ $645.00 Dell Parts
15.6" HD (1366 x 768) Anti-Glare LED Display incluido Dell Parts
|Display 15.6" HD+ {1600 x 900) Wide View Anti-Glare LED Display $135.00 Dell Parts
15.6" Full HD (1920 x 1080) Wide View Anti-Glare LED $184.00 Dell Parts
Video Card NVIDIA Quadro FX 770M, 512MB incluido Dell Parts
NVIDIA Quadro FX 1700M, 512MB $350.00 Dell Parts
9 cell Li-lon Battery $92.00 Dell Parts
2 Years Extended Battery Service for Years 2 and 3 $118.00 Dell Parts
B 2 Bateria Adicional 9 cell Li-lon $150.00 Dell Parts
ateria / AC - -
y 12-Cell High Capacity Battery Slice $269.00 Dell Parts
AC Adapter - Adicional $75.00 Dell Parts
Adicional - Auto/Air/AC Adapter $125.00 Dell Parts
- E-Port Plus, Port Replicator $242.00 Dell Parts
E-Port, Port Replicator $158.00 Dell Parts
E-Legacy Extender $72.00 Dell Parts
Port Replicator .1 E-Modular Bay $60.00 Dell Parts
. E-View Laptop Stand $97.00 Dell Parts

. FYSRLt (LN RS
Caribbean Date ¥’ e
patricio Ave.
636 San 20

juan, PR.
5;'; s 66.028-7124
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Renglon 2, Partida 5

Computadora Portatil (Notebook)

E-Monitor Stand $97.00 Dell Parts
E-Flat Panel Stand $120.00 Dell Parts
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $134.00 E170S
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $174.00 P170S
17 in, 1440 x900, contrast 600:1, Analog $127.00 E1709WFP
19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $155.00 E190S
19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $205.00 P190S
19 in wide, 1440 x 900, contrast 500:1, Analog $160.00 1908W
Monitor Externo 19 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 800:1, Analog/Digital $180.00 P190S AIO
20 in, 1440 x 900, contrast 700:1, Analog $202.00 E2008W
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 700:1, Analog $200.00 P2211H
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 1000:1, Analog/DVi $349.00 P2210 AIQ
23 in, 1920 x1080, contrast 1000:1, Analog/Digital $220.00 E2310H
24 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 1000:1, Analog/Digital/DP $488.00 12410
27 in, 1820 x 1200, contrast 3000:1, Analog/Digital/HDMI $712.00 y2711
30 in, 2560 x 1600, contrast 3000:1, Digital/HDMI $1,494.00 3008WFP
Teclado y Mouse English - USB $40.00 Dell Parts
Externos Optical Mouse - Scroll $30.00 Dell Parts
Maletines Maletin en Nylon $90.00 Dell Parts
Classic Leather Carrying Case $99.00 Dell Parts
Mochila (Backpack) $90.00 Dell Parts
Malentin con ruedas $125.00 APC TC1900RBN
FingerPrint Reader $45.00 Dell Parts
CFI (Customer Factory Install) $50.00 Dell Parts
Floppy USB External $75.00 Dell Parts
Integrated webcam with microphone $35.00 Dell Parts
Wireless® 370 Bluetooth Module $25.00 Dell Parts
Intel® Core™ i5-540M Dual Core 2.53GHz 3MB $75.00 Dell Parts
Intel® Core™ i7-620M Dual Core 2.66GHz 4MB $135.00 Dell Parts
Intel® Core™ i7-720QM Quad Core 1.60GHz 6MB $250.00 Dell Parts
Otras opciones Intel® Core™ i7-840QM Quad Core 1.86GHz 8MB $400.00 Dell Parts
Intel® Core™ i7-940XM Extreme Edition 2.13GHz 8MB $950.00 Dell Parts
AX210 Two Piece Stereo System $31.00 Parts
AX510 Sound Bar for all UltraSharp Flat Panel Displays $48.00 Parts
Intel® vPro™ Secure Advanced Hardware Enabled $27.00 Parts
Microsoft® Office Professional 2010, English $395.00 Parts
UPS with Automatic Voltage Regulation- S00VA $130.00 BR300
Resolution: 800 x 600 (native) / 1600 x 1200 (resized) $715.00 IN2102
Resolution: 1024 x 768 {(native) / 1600 x 1200 (resized) $1,195.00 IN1100
) Incluye Accidente y Pantalla $198.00 Dell Parts
Garantia Adic. Dell Laptop Track.ing_/Recovery 3Yr $92.00 Dell Parts
Dell Laptop Tracking/Recovery & Data Delete 3Yr $130.00 Dell Parts
Keep Your Hard Drive, 3 Years $45.00 Dell Parts
upg to Precision M4510 $0.00 Dell Parts
upg to Precision M6500 $750.00 Dell Parts
. upg to Precision M6500 Covet $1,495.00 Dell Parts
Integrated Webcam with digital microphone $50.00 Dell Parts
. internal English Backlit Keyboard $40.00 Dell Parts
Otras opciones - - -
adicionates Blu-ray Disc™ w Roxio and Cyberlink PDVD $588.00 Parts
- Dell Bluetooth Keyboard/Mouse bundle $120.00 Dell Parts
GOLD Technical Support $115.00 Dell Parts
. |USB Flash Drive $40.00 Dell Parts
Replacement Lamp for Dell IN2102 Projector $185.00 Dell Parts
Replacement Lamp for Dell IN1100 Projector $379.00 Dell Parts

Usuario Avanzado (Power User) Pantalla de 15.4" con procesador intel

Caribbean U.. . “tam ing
636 San Patricio Ave.
San Juan, PR. 00920

S.S. ¥66-028-7124



Irltel Core 2 Duo 519400 (1.86GHz, 6MB L2, 1066MH:}

Tablet PC

Tablet PC

S]_.}?SU‘OD Lenuvo
JChipset Intel 945GM or 945PM Incluido
Memoria: 2 GB (installed) - DDR3 SDRAM - 1066 MHz - PC3-8500 Incluido Carbbean Data Sy
Video Card Integrated Intel GMA 850 Incluido 36 San Patrici
Display 12.1" WVA XGA TFT Incluido
CD/DVD DVD Rec 8x Max Dual Layer (integrado o ext. w cable) Incluido an Jjuan, PR.
Disco Duro: (*) 160 GB - Serial ATA-150 - 5400 rpm Incluido S.S. # 66-028-
NIC Integrated 10/100/1,000 Incluido
Wireless Integrated 802.11 a/b/g Incluido
Modem Integrated 56 Kbps Incluido
Keyboard: |English Incluido
— 2 USB, PC Card (Type | y/o jrype i), Internal Speakers, Headphone/ Incluido
Speaker Out, Integrated Microphone
Floppy ninguno Incluido
Bateria: (*) 6 cell Li-lon Battery Incluido
Peso menor 5 libras (con bateria) Incluido
0s Microsoft Windows 7 Professional Incluido
Garantia 3 afios on-site Incluido
2.0 GB -2 DIMM Incluido Lenovo Parts
IMemoria Total 2.0 GB - 1 DIMM $225.00 Lenovo Parts
3.0GB - 2 DIMM $315.00 Lenovo Parts
4.0 GB - 2 DIMM $535.00 JLenovo Parts
160 GB - internal - 2.5" - SATA-150 - 7200 rpm $88.00 JLenovo Parts
500 GB - internal - SATA-150 - 7200 rpm $185.00 JLenovo Parts
Solid state drive - 256 GB - internal - 1.8" - SATA-300 $807.00 JLenovo Parts
|Disco buro 500 GB - internal - SATA-150 - 5400 rpm - buffer: 8 MB $162.00 JLenovo Parts
320 GB - internal - 2.5" - SATA-150 - 7200 rpm $130.00 JLenovo Parts
250 GB - internal - 2.5" - SATA-150 - 7200 rpm $1,430.00 JLenovo Parts
320 GB - internal - 2.5" - SATA-150 - 5400 rpm - buff: 8 MB $108.00 Lenovo Parts
CD/DVD DVD-ROM 8x Max $0.(?0 Lenovo Parts
DVD Recordable 8x Max Dual Layer Incluido
|Display 14.1" WSXGA No Bid
14.1" WSXGA+ No Bid
14.1" WUXGA No Bid
g cell Li-lon Battery $0.00 Lenovo Parts
Notebook battery - 1 x lithium ion 4-cell 2000 mAh $149.00 43R9256
Bateria / AC Notebook battery - 1 x lithium ion 8-cell 4600 mAh $169.00 43R9257
AC Adapter - Adicional $49.00 40Y7696
Adicional - Auto/Air/AC Adapter $139.00 41R4493
Dock Station 3 USB, NIC (10/100/1000), VGA, AC Adapter, CD/DVD Bay $150.00 41U3120
’ 17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $235.00 5047HB2

Procesador Intel

tem, Inc
Ave.
20
124
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Renglon 3, Partida 1 Tablet PC Tablet PC - Procesador intel

19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $260.00 2448HB6
) 19 in wide, 1440 x 900, contrast 500:1, Analog $265.00 4434HE1 §

Monitor Externo 20 in, 1440 x 900, contrast 700-1, Analog $186.00 2120HB1 £3 ystem, In¢
22 in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 700:1, Analog $347.00 2578HB6 iR o Ave.
24 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 700:1, AnaEE $454.00 4420HB2 r T 00920

Teclado Externo English - USB $55.00 73P2620 . 7124

Mouse Optical Mouse - Scroll $44.00 41U3074

WMahﬂnes Maletin en Nylon $35.00 41U5254
Maletin en Piel $95.00 JParts
Mochila (Backpack) $35.00 41U5254
Ultraportable Case - Notebook carrying case $59.00 41U5062
Malentin con ruedas $125.00 APC TC1S00RBN
FingerPrint Reader $45.00 4103167
Security Cable Lock - Notebook locking cable - 6 ft $45.00 73P2582
ThinkPad X200 Tablet Sleeve $49.00 43R9115
USB WebCam - Web camera - color - audio $48.00 41N5679
Bluetooth Laser Mouse $55.00 4105008

Otras opciones Secure Memory Key - USB flash drive - 2 GB - Hi-Speed USB $59.00 4515916
Tablet Digitizer Pen - Stylus $54.00 4103143
External (USB2) Portable Hard Drive - 120GB 5175.00 41N8379
USB Port Replicator with Digital Video $162.00 45K1610
UPS with Automatic Voltaﬁe Regulation- 750VA $175.00 APC BRBOOBLK

arantia Adic. Incluye Accidente y Pantalla $195.00 JLenovo Parts




Renglén 4: Monitores Caribbean Data System, inc

= - e : R R e S e A 2 A R T R BT 636 San Patricio Ave.
ar Descripcion San Juan, PR. 00920
1 17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $192.00 2% Dell E170S Deli 10 a 20 dias 3 afios S S. # 66‘02 8_71 24
17 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $229.00 2% Dell P170S Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 afios b
17 in, 1440 x900, contrast 600:1, Analog $199.00 2% Dell E1709WFP Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 afios
2 19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $220.00 2% Dell E190S Dell 10 a 20 dias |3 aflos
3 19 in, 1280 x 1024, contrast 500:1, Analog $260.00 2% Dell P190S Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 afios
4 19 in wide, 1440 x 900, contrast 500:1, Analog $228.00 2% Dell 1909w {Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 afos
5 19 in, 1280 x1024, contrast 800:1, Analog/Digital $245.00 2% Dell P190S AIO |Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 aflos
6 20in, 1440 x 900, contrast 700:1, Analog $267.00 2% Dell |E2009W |Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 afios
7 F_zgin, 1680 x 1050, contrast 700:1, Analog $276.00 2% |Dell P2211H Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 afios
8 22in, 1680 x 1050, contrast 1000:1, Analog/DVI 5404.00 2% |Dell P2210 AIO Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 afios.
9 23 in, 1920 x1080, contrast 1000:1, Analog/Digital $257.00 2% |Dell E2310H |Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 aflos
10 24 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 1000:1, Analog/Digital/DP $505.00 2% Dell 1U2410 Dell 10 a 20 dias 3 afios
11 27 in, 1920 x 1200, contrast 3000:1, Analog/Digital/HDMI $776.00 2% Dell U2711 Dell 10 a 20 dias |3 afios
12 30 in, 2560 x 1600, contrast 3000:1, Digital/HDMI $1,559.00 2% Dell J008WFP Dell 10 a 20 dias 1 afios
Renglén 5: Piezas
Partida 1 Teclados y Mouse
11 |USB Keyboard 310-7940 $85.00
12 JUSB Keyboard Wireless {with Card Reader) 310-8021 $125.00
1.3 JUSB Keyboard & Mouse w Scroll Wireless (Bluetooth) 310-8142 $195.00
1.4 JUSB Mini Mouse ADI59686 559.00
1.5 JusB Mouse w Scrall 310-8007 $45.00
1.6 JusB Mouse w Scroll Wireless AD701336 595.00
Partida 2 Disco Duros (adicional o reemplazo)
2.1 |Desktop for Optiplex - B0GE Dell Parts
|Desktop for Optiplex - 160GB Dell Parts
|Desktop for Optiplex - 250G8 Dell Parts
|Desktop for Precision - 160GE Dell Parts
Desktop for Precision - 320GB Dell Parts
Desktop for Precision - S00GB Dell Parts
2.2 JLaptops for Latitude - 80GB Dell Parts
JLaptops for Latitude - 120GB Dell Parts
|Laptops for Precision - 160GB Dell Parts
Seleccionar yna marca e incluir tabla de todas las opciones disponibles con el precio propuesto
Partida 3 Memoria {(adicioani o reemplazo)

diciona! or reemp




Caribbean Data System, inc

31 Desktop for Optiplex, Precision & Others - 1GB (C) Parts e
Desktop for Optiplex, Precision & Others - 1GB Parts 636 S'an Patf Kio AVQ,
Desktop for Optiplex, Precision & Others - 2GB (C) Parts San Juan’ RR wgzo
Desktop for Optiplex, Precision & Others - 2GB Parts S S y
Desktop for Optipiex, Precision & Others - 4GB (C) Parts (R ' 66‘028“71 24
]Desktop for Optiplex, Precision & Others - 4GB Parts
|Desktop for Optiplex, Precision & Others - 8GB Parts
3.2 JLaptops - 1GB (C) Parts
JLaptops - 1GB Parts
JLaptops - 2GB (C) Parts
JLaptops - 3GB Parts
JLaptops - 4GB (C) Parts
Laptops - 4GB Parts
Laptops - 8GB Parts
Seleccionar yng marea e incluir tabla de todas las opciones disponibles con el precio propuesto

Partida 4 Memoria (adicioanl o reemplazo)
i i . ’.:.:1.' :'_'—-l '.‘-s‘i‘
Modelo Costo
41 Portatil BOGB - para notebook Mobile Harddrive $150.00
4.2 Portatil 160GB - para notebook Mobile Harddrive $200.00
4.3 Portatil 2S0GB - para notebook Mobile Harddrive $300.00
4.4 Externos 160GB No bid $0.00
4.5 Externos 250GB No bid 50.
4.6 Externos 320GB D2Quadra $250.00
4.7 Externos 500GB D2Quadra $295.00
Descuento por Volumen
Nim Computadoras % Descuento
0-49 0%
50 - 99 0%
- 100- 199 0%
200 - 299 0%
300 - 399 0%
N 400 - 499 0%
500 - 0%

NOTA: Este descuento por volumen aplica segun el total de computadoras ordenadas por ASG al suplidor en
un misma semana {lunes - viernes). Incluye ordenes de compras de diferentes agencias, corporaciones

publicasw municipios.



OPTIPLEX 780

Organizations that demand versatile mainstream desktop computing and robust remote systems
management will find a cost-effective solution in the new OptiPlex™ 780 desktops. OptiPlex 780
empowers IT with Intel* vPro™ streamlined remote systems management, data and asset-security
solutions, and the kind of chassis serviceability that helps keep working staff productive. The intel*
Core™2 Quad Processor and 88% efficient power supply option on the OptiPlex 780 provide the
perfect combination of technology to drive up performance. Because the OptiPlex 780 offers a
breadth of configuration options, you can build a customized solution that works for your unique
business needs. The stability that the OptiPlex 780 delivers provides the strong foundation you need
for ongoing success.

STABLITY AND MANAGEMENT YOU CAN BUILD ON

Built on proven technology, the OptiPlex delivers stability you can depend on.

« Long-range planning support with a targeted 15-manth hifecycle, stable images, globally available configurations
and managed transitions

+ Dell Client Manager helps make OptiPlex easy to own and easy to manage, with centralized hardware and software
management, inventory control, automation of routine tasks and a unified. expandable feature set

+  Deti Distributed Device Management Services helps you track dispersed assets, distribute software and manage
patches - no matter where your PC clients are located on the internet

SECURITY AND DATA PROTECTION YOU CAN DEPEND ON

Choaose the right kind of security options to help protect your assets, safeguard data and meet compliance.

«  Streamline security operations with Dell Client Manager or Deli Distributed Device Management

»  Protect against unauthorized access with buift-in TPM 1.2%, Smart Card keyboard and Chassis Intrusion Switch

+  Enable secure data protection with Full Disk Encryption Drive or Solid State Drive

+  Protect from drive maifunction with RAID 1 storage technology

+ Improve login and password authentication, security device management and disk encryption control with Dell
ControiPoint™

»  Agtomate, schedule and control backup with Dell Backup and Recovery Manager

WORKING POR YOUR WORKEORCE

With their highly customizable global service and support offerings, OptiPlex desktops empower IT staff with tools

designed for every challenge across the IT life cycle. Give your workforce the desktop features and functions that keep

them productive:

+  Choose high-perfarmance Intel® Core™2 Quad Processors to provide the power for high productivity

+  improve multi-tasking through integrated video support for dual monitors and an optional graphics card to support
up to four monitors

+  Time-saving tool-less chassis design and Deli-innovative DirectDetect troubleshooting LEDs were designed to help
reduce maintenance and service costs

+ Intel* vPro™ technology enables remote system repairs and thereby reduces desk-side visits

ENERGY-EFFICEINCY AT WORK

The OptiPlex 780 emploays energy-efficient technologies that are designed to lower the impact on the environment

while helping to reduce your organization’s energy consumption cost.

*  Reduce power consumption — and costs —~ with optional up to 88% efficient power supplies frorn Dell

¢+ Minimize power usage with Dell Energy Smart power-management technology (available on select configurations)
and recyclable packaging

+ Promote environmental sensitivity with the OptiPlex 780 ENERGY STAR* 5.0 and EPEAT* Gold qualified systems
(avatlable on select configurations)




OptiPlex 780 Techmical Specitications

Irini® Care™2 Cund {* not svailebie on USFFY,

1@ Core™? Ducc

m il Parimn® Dwsi Cors;
nead® Caterun® Dust Cors;
{7l Cataron®

Chipset el O Express Chigsst wCHIDO
Mic:oeciS Windows 79 Besic; MICroso Windows 1 Home Premiom; Windows 79 F Windows 10 Uimete
Microaoh® Wirows Wein@ Home Besic; Microeol® Windows View® Busieass ; M rosold® Windows Vies® Ukmet;

Opersting System _ XPP - via Windows B F

Options X vie Windows 70 Uiwets
Microsolt® Windovws Visin® Susiness vie Windows 18 F
Ubus® Ll (swiact coursriess Frea00S or N-series

o A chesaa- integratad nte¥® Graphics Media Act slerator #500°;

Graphic Options MT/DT/SFF- DVI Adupter cant; 258MB ATI® RADEONS HD MO0 256045 ATI RADEON HD 3470% 25808 NVIDIA GeForce 300 GE™; S12W8 MVIDIA VSR
MI/D/SF- Four DHMM sioty; Non-ECT dus-channel 1IBSME DORS SORAM®, up 10 9GB®

Memory Options USFF- T DSMM sotx; Nor-ECC duak-channel 1000MEHz DDRS SDRAM® , up t 4GB®
MT/DT/SFF. iniagreted intai® SZSETLM Exfvrnet LAN K} KID: cptionst Browdcom® Netrame® HYHIYHOD PCis card; opticne! Brosdcomd® 1508 PCie WLAN card [IEL11 Drat Ny

Networking USH- intagrated ints® I2567LM Externet LAN ¥Y01000; aptiona! Broedcom® 1510 mini PCle WLAN caré f02.11 Drat-b)

- MT/DT/SFF- § Extarnel USB 20 ports and ) inéarmal USB 20; | Paratet 1 Seviat 1 RI45; 1 VBA; 1 Displey Port | 6SATA: 2 Line-in 2tine-cut

USFF- 7 Extacsl USS 2.0 ports; | Seriat; 1 R-48; 1 VGA; 1 Displary Poet; ) 4SATA; 2 Line-ny 2 Ling-out

MT/DT/SFF- 157 Herd Drives: up 10 S00GB* 7200 RPM SATA 30GB/s, up 1o 180GB* 10K RPM SATA 3068/

MT/DT/SFF- 15° Hard Drives: up 10 Z30GB* 7200 RPM SATA 3.0GE/s, 180GB* SATA Fuil Disk Encryption, B4GB® SATA Soié State Drive

Hard Drive Opth USFF- 257 Hard Drive up 10 220G8* 7200 RPM SATA 3.0GIa Drives; HI0GE® SATA Fu Disk Encryption Drives; up to 120GE* SATA Sokd Strte Drives
All chessia- Supports Deifs Flaxibie Computing Solution diskiers option

MT/DT/SFF- RALD 0 & 1 support on select configuretions.

MINITOWER DESKTOP SMALL FORM FACTOR ULTRA SMALL FORM FACTOR
Dimensions WixT4x120/ A5 18T X108/ 3 x124x 134/ AN 28 x0T/
(HxWxD) (LT R8I eRTk ] NAxNIxNY 8.2 x31.4x M0 {.90m x L5cm x ZL8cm)
Inches/(ecm)
Weight (los/kg) BNy 182/828 150 /88 T00/30%

2intwrnal 357 1 internsl 157 ¥imernat 357 1 sxamene! SATA AMSD (stm)
Number of Bays 1 otermal 35° 1 oearet 357 1 mtorne 35” trlimiice) 1 SATA 25" intarnel HOO

Chassis Options 2 oxtmme: 5257 1 oterel 5287 1 xtomal 8.25° (shmina)

1ull height PCle x18 1 iow-prokie PCle xH 1low-profile PCle X168 NA

1 fult height PCle x1 2iow-profiie PC 1 low-profiée PC1
Bxpansion Slots 210l height PCI {Options riser converts the PCls

and PCTimo tul height siots}

DIMM Siots 4 4 4 2

05 Stendard PSU or 25N 255N Standars PSU or optional 255W TIW Standard PSU or aptions! 730 180W up 10 90% EWicient Internasl
Power Supply Unit mmmmm@m 8% Eficient PSL; Energy Star 5.6 58% Eficient FSU5: Energy Star 0 #SU, CHERGY STAR 8.5 compton,
(PSU) complient, Active PFC compliant, Active PFC comphient, Active PFC Active PFC
Monitnes:
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A CHANGE IN VALUE

DELL E SERIES

THE AFFORDABLE, EASY-TO-USE
BUSINESS PERFORMER

HIGHLIGHTS

* Spacious viewing area

* Slesk, space-saving design

* Budgaet friandly

= Bait upgrade for CRT monitors users
« ENERGY STAR' compliant

RECOMMENDED FOR

Totall chaing srmallt




TIvITY

MHMENSION (WITH STAND)




